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Serious undertones of pampering are
present in the character's voice, her choice

of clothes and jewelry, and in the book's
setting. The monologue in which this is

introduced is ostensibly about the coming
of age of the character, a girl named Cali,

but there is a subtext about remaining
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single until marriage. When the single
character's mother complains to her about
getting married "too young," the subtext is
"What, are you nuts? I didn't get married

until I was thirty. And my mother got
married at the age of twenty-one. You're
just a child!" Her point about not being

married until after her first child is made
explicit in the first and last chapters, when

Cali marries and gives birth. When she
moves away from her family, the text

mirrors her actual life; Cali's sister is likely
to be married to the man she loves and

pregnant with his child before her, and Cali
herself is not married until after her
daughter's first birthday. This text is

central to the book's theme of remaining
single. It is this sense of superior authority

over the reader, combined with her
character's unspoken coolness, that
creates the feeling of an older, more

experienced person lecturing and insulting
the reader. Summary: This book is about a
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year-long stay by a woman at a quiet
country manor that her family is renting for

the summer. She has been raised by her
mother and, now that she is a teenager, is
waiting to get married and have children.

The main character is about to turn twenty-
two, but is often referred to as a "child". In
this setting, her attitude is that of someone

who has experienced more than most
people, has things figured out, and does
not need to have her plans for the future

changed by her family. The "young"
reader's perspective is that of one who has

to go to school, work, make friends, get
married and have children before being
able to have any real plans of her own.
Critical reception The main character,
Phyllida, is treated with a great deal of

sympathy by her family's servants. Unlike
most of the other ladies there, she is
portrayed as having a great deal of

independence and freedom, even though
she has basically nothing else to do but
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wallow in her mother's disorder of a father
and his various careers. She grows up in

her grandmother's world, living in a calm,
luxurious setting
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